

Course Date	Course Name	Sponsoring Organization	Proposed # of CLE Credits	# General WC Credits	Trial Practice/Litigation Credits	# Medical-Related Credits	# Ethics Credits Approved by Standing Committee	Number of Total Credits Approved by Standing Committee
05/05/06	Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>7.00</b>			6.0	1.0	7.00
06/12/06	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - WC Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
06/12/06	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting Appellate Case Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
07/25/06	Advanced Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	<b>6.50</b>	6.50				6.50
09/06/06	24th Annual College of Evidence	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00
09/22/06	Advanced Workers' Compensation in CT	Lorman Education Services	<b>6.00</b>				6.0	6.00
10/05/06	Packing Your Parachute	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>5.50</b>	3.00			2.5	5.50
10/20/06	Attacking the Experts Opinion	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.50</b>	6.50				6.50
11/10/06	Ugliest Seminar of the Year	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>1.00</b>				1.0	1.00
12/07/06	Courtroom Medicine: The Musculoskeletal System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>			5.0	1.0	6.00
12/12/06	How to Identify Ethical Traps and Avoid Grievances	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				4.0	4.00
01/10/07	The Rules Have Changed... What Every Lawyer Needs to Know About the Revisions to the Rules of Professional Conduct	HCT Bar Institute, Inc. - Hartford County Bar Association	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
01/16/07	The New Ethics Rules	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>				3.0	3.00
02/27/07	Advanced Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	<b>6.50</b>	6.50				6.50
03/01/07	WC Tips and Tactics from Both Sides of the Table	NBI - National Business Institute	<b>3.00</b>	3.00				3.00
03/02/07	Workers' Compensation Advanced Topics	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.50</b>	5.50			1.0	6.50
03/19/07	Appellate Advocacy: Drafting and Presenting a Winning Appellate Brief	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>		2.00			2.00
03/20/07	The New Ethics Rules	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.50</b>				3.5	3.50
05/03/07	Workers' Compensation Seminar Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>8.00</b>	3.50		3.5	1.0	8.00
06/14/07	Supreme & Appellate Court Review: Workers' Compensation Review	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>3.50</b>	3.50				3.50
06/18/07	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Appellate Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
06/18/07	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - WC Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
06/28/07	Avoiding Ethical Pitfalls	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				4.0	4.00
09/05/07	WC Strategies for Litigating the Case	NBI - National Business Institute	<b>3.00</b>	2.00			1.0	3.00
09/14/07	Independent Contractors vs. Employees - Can You Tell the Difference?	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
09/18/07	What Do We Do Now? How to Comply With the Updated Rules of Professional Conduct and Practice Book Revisions	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.50</b>				3.5	3.50
10/05/07	Winning Deposition Techniques	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00

10/17/07	Legal Ethics	Lorman Education Services	6.00				6.0	6.00
10/25/07	Lumbar Fusions - Procedures & Alternatives	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	5.50			4.5	1.0	5.50
11/02/07	The Battle of the Bulge! Presenting & Proving the Medicine in Neck & Back Cases	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	4.00	4.00				4.00
02/01/08	How to Identify Ethical Traps and Avoid Grievances	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00				4.0	4.00
02/08/08	Workers' Compensation Seminar - Settlement Minefields	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.00				4.50
02/27/08	WC Update in CT		6.00	5.50			0.5	6.00
03/07/08	Ethical Traps and Landmines for the Unwary WC Section	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	2.50			1.5	4.00
03/11/08	ERISA	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.50	3.50				3.50
04/11/08	The Ten Most Wanted: Keys to an Effective Cross	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	3.50	3.50				3.50
05/01/08	Workers' Compensation Section Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00	4.00		1.0	1.0	6.00
05/08/08	Litigating the Uninsured & Underinsured Motorist Claim	NBI - National Business Institute	1.50		1.00		0.5	1.50
05/14/08	Select Developments in Labor Law and Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
05/16/08	Recognizing and Proving the Invisible Injury	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	5.00			5.0		5.00
05/19/08	Workers' Compensation Settlements with Medicare Implications	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
05/20/08	Workers' Compensation Law Update	NBI - National Business Institute	6.00	6.00				6.00
06/02/08	Supreme & Appellate Court Review: Workers' Compensation Review	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	2.50	2.50				2.50
06/09/08	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Appellate Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
06/09/08	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - WC Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
06/26/08	National Workers' Compensation Defense Seminar	NWCDN	5.50	5.50				5.50
09/19/08	Everything Expert	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50		4.50			4.50
10/22/08	DRI Annual Meeting and Seminar	Defense Research Institute	3.00	3.00				3.00
11/06/08	Asbestos Medicine Seminar	DRI	14.00	1.00		12.0	1.0	14.00
11/07/08	Best Practices in ADA, FMLA and Workers' Compensation in CT	Lorman Education Services	7.00	7.00				7.00
11/07/08	Professionalism Symposium	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
11/07/08	The Ugliest Seminar of the Year	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.00				1.0	1.00
11/12/08	Annual Risk Management Day/WC Update	PRIMA	3.00	3.00				3.00
11/14/08	Joint Replacement Surgery: New Treatment Options with Noted Physicians	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00			6.0		6.00
11/19/08	Sick of School? Indoor Air Quality and Mold: Litigation in Public Schools and Beyond	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00			1.0		1.00
12/06/08	26th Annual College of Evidence	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	3.00	3.00				3.00
12/10/08	Annual Risk Management Day/WC Update	PRIMA	3.00	3.00				3.00

01/14/09	Pain Management and Work-Related Injuries	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00		2.0		2.00
01/21/09	Workers' Comp Hearings	NBI - National Business Institute	6.00	5.00			1.0	6.00
01/30/09	Pozner & Dodd on "Killer" Cross Examination	HCT Bar Institute, Inc. - Hartford County Bar Association	6.00	6.00				6.00
2/3/2009- 2/4/2009	6th Annual National Workers' Compensation Insurance ExecuSummit	ExecuSummit	8.00	8.00				8.00
02/05/09	The Complete MSA Training Course	MSA Education	15.00	15.00				15.00
02/05/09	Workers' Compensation Update Seminar in CT	Lorman Education Services	7.00	6.50			0.5	7.00
02/06/09	WC Law Seminar - Functional Capacity Evals?	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50			4.5		4.50
02/06/09	Workers' Compensation Seminar	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	6.00			5.0	1.0	6.00
02/20/09	New Ethics Rules Need To Know	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.00				1.0	1.00
03/06/09	The State of the State in Workers' Compensation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.50	4.50				4.50
04/30/09	Workers' Compensation Section Seminar Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00	5.00			1.0	6.00
05/05/09	Cardiology College	Hartford Hospital	7.00			7.0		7.00
05/19/09	Advanced WC	Sterling Education Services	6.00	6.00				6.00
06/08/09	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting: Appellate Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
06/08/09	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting: WC Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
06/08/09	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting: Ethics Rules & Advertising, Communication & Random Audits	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
06/08/09	CTLA Annual Meeting - Supreme & Appellate Court Review; WC Review; Three Verdicts	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	5.00	5.00				5.00
06/19/09	Teleseminar: Medicare, Medicaid, & SCHIP Extension Act of 2007	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
10/01/09	Civil Court Judicial Forum: Advanced Discovery and Trial Practice	NBI - National Business Institute	3.00	3.00				3.00
10/15/09	Mastering Difficult Issues in Workers' Compensation	NWCDN - National WC Defense Network	5.00	4.00		1.0		5.00
10/30/09	Professionalism Symposium	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00	3.00				3.00
11/06/09	Heart & Hypertension: A Cardiac College	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.00			7.0		7.00
11/06/09	Trial Demonstration: Cross Examination of Experts	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	5.50		5.50			5.50
11/10/09	Advanced Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	6.50	6.50				6.50
11/12/09	Asbestos Medicine Seminar	DRI	16.00	9.50		5.5	1.0	16.00
11/20/09	Defective Premises	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
12/04/09	Employment Law: Doing Well and Doing Right	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
01/28/10	WC Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00	5.00			1.0	6.00
02/05/10	Using the Pain Mgmt. Specialists in PI & WC Cases	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.00		4.00			4.00
02/08/10	Workers' Compensation Practice - Supreme Court Caselaw	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00

02/18/10	Practicing Law in Compliance with Ethical Standards	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00				4.0	4.00
03/12/10	Vocational Options	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	4.00				4.00
04/19/10	Deposition Practice and Procedure: How to Take and Use Deposition Testimony Effectively	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00		1.00			1.00
04/26/10	Workers' Compensation 101: Introductory Topics	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00					
06/07/10	2010 Annual Meeting - Three Verdicts	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.00	1.00				1.00
06/07/10	2010 Annual Meeting - WC Review	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.00	1.00				1.00
06/14/10	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Appellate Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
06/14/10	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Building a Solid Foundation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
06/14/10	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - WC Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
10/01/10	Personal Injury Settlements and Medicare Set-aside Offsets	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.50	6.50				6.50
10/07/10	Fall Workers' Compensation Symposium	NWCDN - National WC Defense Network	3.50	3.50				3.50
10/29/10	Courtroom Medicine: A Thorough Medical Review of the Anatomy/Physiology of the Neck and Shoulder and a Discussion of Post-Getting the Ugly Out of Medicare, Medicaid, Erisa, and Other Alleged Third Party Liens: Claimed "Liens" on Personal Injury Cases	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.00			6.0	1.0	7.00
11/19/10	Stratton Faxon - Connecticut's Firm for Trial Law	4.00	4.00					4.00
12/03/10	Navigating Medicare, Etc	Perrin	6.00	5.00		1.0		6.00
12/03/10	The Ugliest Seminar of the Year	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	3.50	3.50				3.50
01/29/11	Uninsured/Underinsured Motorist Cases	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	3.00	3.00				3.00
02/01/11	8th Annual WC Insurance ExecuSummit	ExecuSummit	8.00	8.00				8.00
02/04/11	Workers' Compensation Seminar	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.00	2.00	2.00			4.00
02/18/11	Expert Witnesses	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	4.50		4.50			4.50
03/25/11	Payor and Medical Provider Guidelines	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	4.00				4.00
04/06/11	Advanced WC	Sterling Education Services	6.50	6.50				6.50
04/06/11	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Workers' Compensation Section Meeting Presentation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00			1.0		1.00
04/07/11	Upper Extremity Injuries	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00			3.0		3.00
04/12/11	Workers' Compensation Update	Lorman Education Services	6.00	6.00				6.00
04/23/11	Practicing Law in Compliance with Ethical Standards	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00				4.0	4.00
04/28/11	Thre Oughta Be A Law: How to Identify, Define, and Properly Litigate Civil Causes of Action in Conn.	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
5/5/2011-5/7/2011	Annual Workers' Compensation Section Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00	3.00		2.0	1.0	6.00
05/23/11	A Lawyer's Primer on Expert Witnesses: When To Use Them, How To Find Them, and How To Effectively Use Them	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00		1.50		0.5	2.00
06/13/11	2011 CTLA Annual Meeting	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.00	1.00				1.00
06/23/11	2011 Annual Meeting - Building a Solid Foundation - Managing Law Practice Risk	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00

06/23/11	2011 Annual Meeting - Current Issues of Interest in the Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
06/23/11	2011 Annual Meeting - Annual Review of Appellate Cases with Kenneth Bartschi & Karen Dowd	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
06/23/11	2011 Annual Meeting – The Final Word: Understanding The Final Judgment Rule and Its Exceptions	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>		1.00			1.00
08/08/11	Getting the Ugly Out of Medicare,ERISA, and Other Alleged Third Party Liens	NHCT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>	3.00				3.00
09/10/11	29th Annual College of Evidence	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>		2.00			2.00
09/15/11	Great Adverse Depositions: Principles and Principal Techniques	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.50</b>		6.50			6.50
09/16/11	Attacking the Expert's Opinion	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.50</b>		6.50			6.50
09/30/11	Trial Demonstration of a Low Impact MVA Case	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	<b>5.00</b>		5.00			5.00
10/19/11	Workers' Compensation Meeting - How to Settle/Mediate the Complex Workers' Compensation Matter	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
10/26/11	Powerful Persuasive Writing...With an Ethics Twist	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>	2.00			1.0	3.00
10/27/11	Powerful Persuasive Writing...With an Ethics Twist	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>	2.00			1.0	3.00
11/02/11	7th Annual Advanced Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	<b>6.50</b>	6.50				6.50
11/04/11	Psychiatric Claims and Their Interplay with Pain	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>8.00</b>	8.00				8.00
11/09/11	Lawyer Ethics in a Corporate Setting: Corporate Counsel for the 21st Century	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
11/10/11	Advanced Workers' Compensation	NBI - National Business Institute	<b>6.00</b>	4.00	1.00	1.0		6.00
11/11/11	Getting the Ugly Out of Medicare, Medicaid, Erisa, and Other Alleged Third Party Liens: Claimed "Liens" on Personal Injury Cases	Stratton Faxon - Connecticut's Firm for Trial Law	<b>2.50</b>	2.50				2.50
11/19/11	Getting the Ugly Out of Liens - Westport	Stratton Faxon	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00
11/29/11	Navigating Connecticut's New E-Discovery Rules	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>		2.00			2.00
12/01/11	Ethics Pitfalls for New and Not-So-New Attorneys	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/02/11	Building a Solid Foundation Managing Law Practice RisK	HCT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
12/20/11	Advanced Workers' Comp	Sterling Education Services	<b>6.50</b>	6.50				6.50
01/09/12	Medicaid/Medicare Primer	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
01/13/12	Neck & Back Injuries	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	<b>2.50</b>		2.50			2.50
02/03/12	Workers' Compensation Seminar: A Toolbox for Basic and Advanced Claims	CTLA - Civil Justice Foundation, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00
02/17/12	More Bang for the Buck	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
02/24/12	The Medicare Lien Resolution Process	CTLA - Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
3/4/2012- 3/6/2012	Annual Workers' Compensation Section Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>7.00</b>	3.00		2.0	1.0	7.00
04/13/12	Picking to Win - Box Jury Selection	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
04/19/12	Complying with the Connecticut Rules of Professional Conduct: Avoiding Malpractice and Disciplinary Traps	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				4.0	4.00
04/23/12	Use of Vocational Experts and Functional Capacity Exams in the Workers' Compensation Forum	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00

05/18/12	Liens and Outside Benefits that Can Affect Workers' Compensation Claims and Indemnity Benefits	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.50</b>	3.50			1.0	4.50
05/30/12	Pain Management	GBBA - Greater Bridgeport Bar Association	<b>2.00</b>			2.0		2.00
06/04/12	WC 2012 Appellate Court Annual Meeting	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Workers' Compensation Update	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>	3.00				3.00
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Annual Appellate Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	3.00				1.50
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Nuts and Bolts of Trial Advocacy	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>			1.5		1.50
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Administrative Practice from the Basics to the Advanced	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ethics: Past, Present, Future	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Connecticut, Say Hello to E-Discovery	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>			3.0		3.00
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Adaptable Law (Risk Management)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
06/11/12	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Annual Review of Appellate Cases	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
09/19/12	ERISA Claim Litigation 101	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.50</b>	3.50				3.50
10/12/12	Litigating & Winning Employment Cases	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00
10/26/12	Courtroom Medicine: Addressing Back and Hip Claims	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>7.00</b>			6.0	1.0	7.00
11/09/12	Trial Skills Part I of III: Basic Trial Preparation Skills	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
12/07/12	Ugliest Seminar of the Year	Civil Justice/CTLA	<b>4.00</b>	3.50			0.5	4.00
12/11/12	Advanced Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	<b>6.50</b>	5.50			1.0	6.50
01/10/13	Employee Sick Leave: ADA, CFEPA, FMLA, and Sick Leave	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00
01/11/13	Trial Skills Part II: of III: Deposition Skills & Techniques	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.00</b>	4.00				4.00
01/17/13	A Practical Guide to Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	<b>8.00</b>	8.00				8.00
02/15/13	Workers' Comp: Covering All the Bases	Civil Justice/CTLA	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
02/25/13	Interplay of HIPAA and Attorney Client Privilege (2/25/13)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>		1.00		1.0	2.00
03/03/13	Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>	1.00		4.0	1.0	6.00
03/15/13	Trial Skills Part III: Tactics & Techniques for Direct & Cross Examination	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>3.00</b>	3.00				3.00
04/03/13	Workers' Compensation Section Meeting	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
04/05/13	Bad Faith - Negligent Failure to Settle	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
05/17/13	Understanding the Workers' Comp Appeals Process	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.50</b>		4.50			4.50
06/10/13	WC 2013 Appellate Court Annual Meeting	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
06/17/13	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Workers' Comp Annual Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
06/17/13	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Annual Appellate Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00

06/17/13	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - The Adaptable Lawyer: Staying Practical in Today's Complex Legal Environment	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
06/17/13	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ethics - A Year in Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
06/17/13	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Annual Review of Appellate Cases	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
09/17/13	Practical Guide to WC	Sterling Education Services	6.50	6.50				6.50
10/03/13	100th Anniversary Symposium	CT Workers Compensation Commission	5.00	5.00				5.00
10/04/13	Rules of the Road for Direct & Cross Examination	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.50				4.50
11/01/13	Raising the Bar: A Bench Bar Symposium on Professionalism in the Judicial District of Fairfield	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00				3.0	3.00
12/05/13	Civility Matters - Discussions on Dealing with Difficult Lawyers and Difficult Situations	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
12/06/13	Expert Witness	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.50				4.50
03/08/14	Interplay of Bankruptcy & Workers' Compensation Claims	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00	3.00				3.00
03/13/14	Advanced Workers' Compensation Seminar - New Mexico	Sterling Education Services	4.00	3.00			1.0	4.00
03/14/14	College of Automobile Law	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.50				4.50
03/15/14	Workers' Compensation Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00	5.00			1.0	6.00
04/25/14	Workers' Compensation - Challenges to Compensability	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.50				4.50
04/25/14	Trial Skills Part III: Tactics & Techniques for Direct & Cross Examination	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50		4.50			4.50
05/09/14	Nothing Up My Sleeve, Nothing in My "Hatt": A Medical-Legal Journey into the World of Repetitive Trauma Hand/Wrist Injuries	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00			4.0		4.00
06/02/14	Annual Meeting	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.00	1.00				1.00
06/16/14	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Annual Update in Workers' Compensation Law	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
06/16/14	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ethics - Year in Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50				1.5	1.50
06/16/14	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Competitive Edge - Risk Management	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50				1.5	1.50
06/16/14	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Annual Review of Appellate Cases	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
06/16/14	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Extraordinary Review of Unpreserved Issues on Appeal: How to Beg for Mercy	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
09/19/14	Advanced Workers' Compensation	Sterling Education Services	6.50	5.50			1.0	6.50
10/17/14	Workers' Compensation Courtroom Medicine Conference	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.00			7.0		7.00
11/7/2014	Raising the Bar: A Bench-Bar Symposium on Professionalism	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00				3.0	3.00
12/05/14	Ugliest Seminar of the Year: Lein Rights in Personal Injury Litigation	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.00			0.5	4.50
02/06/15	The Ten Most Wanted: Keys to Admitting & Excluding Evidence	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.50	4.50				4.50
02/25/15	Special Needs Trust	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00	3.00				3.00
02/27/15	Workers' Compensation: Revisiting the CT Workers' Compensation Act	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association						
03/20/15	Avoiding Settlement Horror Stories	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	1.50					1.50

03/20/15	Pick'em & Win: The Art and Science of Jury Selection	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
03/27/15	Ethics in Workers' Compensation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				4.0	4.00
05/16/15	Worker's Compensation Exotic Seminar	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>7.00</b>	6.00			1.0	7.00
06/08/15	Annual Meeting	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
06/15/15	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ethics: The Year in Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
06/15/15	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ethics & Social Media	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>				1.0	1.00
06/15/15	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Current Issues in the Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
06/15/15	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - The Competitive Edge: Law Practice Risk Management	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
06/15/15	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Navigating the Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
09/11/15	Pain, Pills and Pot: Workers' Compensation Courtroom Medicine Conference	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.50</b>	6.50				6.50
10/21/15	WC Section Meeting	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
11/06/15	The Legal Profession on Trial: Professionalism in the 21st Century	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>				3.0	3.00
11/13/15	Arguing Damages - Maximizing the Verdict	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
12/04/15	Trial Demonstration of a Trip & Fall Case	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
12/05/15	Advanced Workers' Compensation Seminar - New Orleans	Sterling Education Services	<b>3.00</b>	2.00			1.0	3.00
12/08/15	Ethics: Avoiding Common Pitfalls in Law Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/15/15	Advanced Workers' Compensation Seminar	Sterling Education Services	<b>7.50</b>	6.50			1.0	7.50
02/02/16	Complying with the Connecticut Rules of Professional Conduct: Avoiding Discipline & Malpractice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>				6.0	6.00
02/05/16	Causation and Controversy: An Orthopedic Perspective	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
03/04/16	Lessons from the Doctors	Civil Justice/CTLA	<b>4.50</b>			4.5		4.50
03/06/16	WC Retreat - Puerto Rico	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>	5.00			1.0	6.00
03/18/16	Deadly Depositions	Civil Justice/CTLA	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
03/30/16	Ethics 301	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				4.0	4.00
04/28/16	Perfecting an Understanding of Liens in Workers' Compensation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>					
06/06/16	Advanced Workers' Compensation Seminar	Sterling Education Services, Inc	<b>7.50</b>	6.50			1.0	7.50
06/06/16	Annual Meeting: Worker's Comp Review	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
06/09/16	Fundamentals of WC	Sterling Education Services	<b>2.00</b>	1.00			1.0	2.00
06/13/16	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Doctors Depositions in Workers' Compensation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>					
06/13/16	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Current Issues in the Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>					
06/13/16	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ahead of the Curve: Ethics in Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50

06/13/16	CT Bar Institute, Inc. Annual Meeting - Ethics: Year in Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
06/13/16	Navigating Connecticut's "Toughest in the Nation" Medical Marijuana Regulations	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
06/13/16	30 Cool Tools for Lawyers (2016CLC-D11)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>					1.50
6/13/2016	CLC-09 Negotiation Styles and Strategies	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50					1.50
6/16/2016	Negotiating WC Settlement	NBI	4.50	3.50			1.0	4.50
09/16/16	Ethics: IOLTA / Law Practice Management	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>					
09/30/16	Workers' Compensation Courtroom Medicine Conference	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.50</b>					
10/05/16	WC Cases from Start to Finish	NBI	<b>3.25</b>	3.25				3.25
10/11/16	Protecting Medicare's Interest in Workers' Compensation and Liability Settlements	NBI	<b>7.00</b>	7.00				7.00
10/18/16	Complying with the CT Rules of Professional Conduct: Avoiding Discipline & Malpractice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>				6.0	6.00
11/09/16	CT's New MCLE Rules	State of CT Judicial Branch	<b>1.00</b>				1.0	1.00
12/09/16	The New CT MCLE Rule	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
12/9/2016-12/10/2016	Weekend with the Stars	American Trial Lawyers Association	3.00	2.00			1.0	3.00
12/13/2016	Advanced WC	SES	1.00				1.0	1.00
01/20/17	The Ugliest Seminar of 2017 - Liens, Ethics & Collateral Sources: What Every Plaintiff's Lawyer Needs to Know	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>3.75</b>	3.75				3.75
02/03/17	Settlement of a Claim from Beginning to End	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	<b>4.50</b>	4.50				4.50
02/28/17	Complying with the CT Rules of Professional Conduct: Avoiding Discipline & Malprac CLE (EPE170228)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>5.00</b>				5.0	5.00
3/5/2017	WC Retreat	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.00	6.00			1.0	7.00
03/20/17	Attorney-Client Privilege in Email	NBI	<b>1.00</b>				1.0	1.00
03/28/17	Auto Injury Litigation	NBI	<b>5.00</b>	4.00			1.0	5.00
04/27/17	Medicaid 101, The Nuts & Bolts of Title XIX	GBBA	<b>2.00</b>					2.00
04/28/17	Ethical Issues Facing a Workers' Compensation Practitioner	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				4.0	4.00
06/12/17	Workers' Compensation: By the Numbers	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
06/12/17	Current Issues in Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>	1.50				1.50
06/12/17	Ahead of the Curve: Ethics in Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
06/12/17	Ethics: The Year in Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
06/12/17	The Essentials of IOLTA	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.50</b>				1.5	1.50
6/12/2017	Advanced Negotiations Workshop for Litigators, Part 1	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50		1.50			1.50
6/12/2017	Advanced Negotiations Workshop for Litigators, Part 2	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50		1.50			1.50
6/12/2017	Harnessing Technology (2017CLC-D07)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50					1.50

6/12/2017	The Opioid Crisis (2017CLC-A01)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50					1.50
09/15/17	IOLTA Compliance and Avoiding Ethical Pitfalls in Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>				3.0	3.00
9/15/2017	How to Get Your Social Media Email and Text Evidence Admitted	National Business Institute	5.25				0.5	5.25
10/11/17	Complying with the CT Rules of Professional Conduct: Avoiding Discipline & Malpractice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>5.50</b>				5.5	5.50
10/20/17	Workers' Compensation on the Brain	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>	6.00				6.00
11/01/17	Anatomy of a Special Needs Trust	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
11/14/17	Lunch and Learn with the CT Bar Institute, Inc.! Social Media Evidence CLE (EDU171114)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>					1.00
11/17/17	WC Medicare Secondary Payer Compliance	GBBA	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
11/28/2017	Lien Issues & Collateral Sources	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	2.00					2.00
12/05/17	Hot Topics in Ethics	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/5/2017	Workers' Compensation from A to Z - Day 1	National Business Institute	6.00				1.0	6.00
12/06/17	Ethics and Intellectual Property: Traps, Pitfalls, and Adventures in IP Lawyering	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.50</b>	0.50			2.0	2.50
12/6/2017	Workers' Compensation from A to Z - Day 2	National Business Institute	6.00					6.00
01/21/18	Workers' Compensation Retreat CLE (SWC180121)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>7.00</b>	4.50			2.5	7.00
01/24/18	Ethics in Practice CLE (EPF180124)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
02/02/18	Breaking Down Complex WC Issues	Civil Justice Foundation	<b>4.00</b>	3.00			1.0	4.00
02/08/18	Complete Workers' Comp	CTLA	<b>4.00</b>					4.00
03/15/18	Annual Advanced Employment Law Symposium	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>4.00</b>				1.0	1.00
3/29/2018	Valuation and Legal Issues that Arise in Settlement of WC Cases	New Haven County Bar Association	3.00					3.00
4/10/2018	New Workers' Comp Medicare Set-Aside Rules: Essential Info You Need to Know	National Business Institute	1.50					1.50
04/20/18	75 is the New 65: The Aging Workforce and Its Impact on Workers' Compensation Practice CLE(EWC180420)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.25</b>	3.25				3.25
04/20/18	David Ball, PhD On Damages	CTLA	<b>6.00</b>	5.00			1.0	6.00
04/24/18	Handling Thorny Ethical Issues in Commercial Litigation CLE (EDU180424)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
6/11/2018	Current Issues in the Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
6/11/2018	A "Frolic and Detour" in Workers' Compensation Case Law	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
6/11/2018	Workplace Absence: How to Avoid Pitfalls Caused by the Interplay of Disability, Medical Leave, and Workers' Compensation Law	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>	2.00				2.00
6/11/2018	Ethics: The Year in Review	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>				1.0	1.00
6/11/2018	The Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What It Means to Your Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>				1.0	1.00
6/11/2018	Annual Update on Administrative Law Practice and Legislation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>1.00</b>	1.00				1.00
6/11/2018	Shifting Landscapes: Adapting Your Firm to Emerging Threats	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00

6/11/2018	60 Legal Tech Trips, Tricks, Gadgets and Websites in 60 Minutes	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00					1.00
6/20/2018	Traumatic Brain Injury Cases: Doctor and Attorney Perspectives	National Business Institute	6.00			5.0	1.0	6.00
8/14/2018	Workers' Compensation Fundamentals	National Business Institute	6.00				1.0	6.00
9/14/2018	Legal Ethics: Maintaining IOLTA & Law Office Management Best Practices CLE (EDU180914)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>3.00</b>				3.0	3.00
10/4/2018	Cyber Security	Greater Bridgeport Bar Association	1.00					1.00
10/5/2018	Workers' Compensation Courtroom Medicine Conference: Repetitive Trauma Injuries CLE (EWC181005)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>6.00</b>			6.0		6.00
10/5/2018	Special Needs Trust Planning for Persons with a Disability	National Business Institute	6.00					6.00
10/23/2018	Ethical Considerations in Your Practice CLE (EPE181023)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>5.50</b>				5.5	5.50
12/3/2018	Is This Right?: Ethics Issues for Criminal and Small Firm Attorneys CLE (EYL181203)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/5/2018	Tools to Ethically Manage Client Trust Accounts CLE (EPE181205)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/5/2018	Ethics and Intellectual Property: Traps, Pitfalls, and Adventures in IP Lawyering CLE (EIP181205)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/7/2018	Workers' Compensation Updates	Greater Bridgeport Bar Association	1.50	1.00			0.5	1.50
12/11/2018	Ethics for the Government Lawyer CLE (EDU181211)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
12/18/2018	The Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What Every Lawyer Needs to Know CLE (EPE181218)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	<b>2.00</b>				2.0	2.00
1/18/2019	The Ugliest Seminar of 2019	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.00	3.50			0.5	4.00
1/25/2019	Understanding the WC Appeals (AD051231)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00					4.00
1/29/2019	New Workers' Comp Medicare Set-Aside Rules: Essential Info You Need to Know	National Business Institute	1.50					1.50
2/7/2019	Advanced Strategies for Negotiating Claims within Insurance Companies	National Business Institute	3.00		3.00			3.00
2/8/2019	The Latest Issues in Workers' Compensation	Connecticut Trial Lawyers Association	4.00					4.00
2/26/2019	Managing Your IOLTA: What You Don't Know and What to Do about It	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00					2.00
3/8/2019	The Impact of the New Evidence Rules on Workers' Compensation Cases	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.50					3.50
3/12/2019	CMS: MSP Recovery Portal Electronic Payment Enhancement		1.00					1.00
3/13/2019	NAMSAP: What's Trending, WCMSA Reference Guide Update	NAMSAP	1.00					1.00
3/13/2019	Key Medical Expert Deposition and Cross-Examination Tactics	National Business Institute	6.00				1.0	6.00
4/2/2019	Ethical Considerations in Your Practice	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	5.50					5.50
4/4/2019	75 is the New 35 (EWC171205)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00					2.00
4/22/2019	Litigation in the Software Age/Trial Technology	Geomatrix	1.00		1.00			1.00
5/6/2019-5/7/2019	Workers' Compensation Retreat	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	8.25				2.0	8.25
5/15/2019	Rule of Law: What is Our Ethical and Moral Duty	CBF	2.00	1.00			1.0	2.00
5/22/2019	New Workers' Comp Set Aside Rules: Essential Info You Need to Know	National Business Institute	3.00	3.00				3.00

6/3/2019	Debunking Common Medicare Secondary Payer Compliance Myths	Verisk	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/10/2019	Shifting Landscapes: Adapting Your Firm to Emerging Threats (2019CLC-A04/D04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/10/2019	Ethics: The Year in Review (2019CLC-B05)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/10/2019	The Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What Every Lawyer Needs to Know (2019CLC-C04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/10/2019	Current Issues in the Workers' Compensation System	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00					2.00
6/10/2019	Attacking the Liar's "I Don't Remember"	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/10/2019	Annual Review of CT Supreme & Appellate Court Cases	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/10/2019	Beyond 40 Hrs: Federal and State Wage and Hour Update	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/10/2019	Don't Forget About US (2019CLC)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/10/2019	Essentials in Navigating a Workers' Comp Claim	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00					1.00
6/11/2019	What is in your WCMSA Approval	NAMSAP	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/24/2019	CTLA Annual Meeting - WC Review	CTLA	3.00	3.00				3.00
7/16/2019	Liability and Medicare Secondary Payer	NAMSAP	1.00			1.0		1.00
9/1/2019	Civil Trial Start to Finish		6.00					6.00
9/2/2019	How to Lose a Client in 10 Days	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.00			0.5	1.50
9/10/2019	Marketing Your Law Practice: Strategies, Tools, and Ethics	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	1.50			0.5	2.00
9/19/2019	Autopalooza	CTLA	8.00	7.00			1.0	8.00
10/17/2019	Hot Topic in WC - PTSD & Medical Marijuana	FCBA	8.50	8.50				8.50
10/28/2019	Solve Your Conditional Payment Challenges	ISO Claim Parties(?)	1.00	1.00				1.00
11/1/2019	Game of Bones: The Science and Strategy of Orthopedic Claims	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.25	6.25			1.0	7.25
11/8/2019	Raising the Bar: A Bench-Bar Symposium	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00				3.0	3.00
11/21/2019	Ethics	TCT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
11/21/2019	How Humana Enforces the MSP Statute	Ametros	1.00			1.0		1.00
12/4/2019	New Workers' Comp Set Aside Rules: Essential Info You Need to Know		1.50					1.50
12/6/2019	Professionalism Boot Camp	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	1.00			3.0	4.00
12/11/2019	Workers Compensation from Start to Finish (Attend)	National Business Institute	4.00			1.0	1.0	4.00
12/11/2019	WC Law from Start to Finish (Present)	National Business Institute	6.00					6.00
12/13/2019	The Business of Lawyering	Statewide Grievance & WCT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00					2.00
12/16/2019	Personal Injury Claims for Uber/Lyft Accidents (5/29/19)	Strafford Webinar	1.50	1.50				1.50
12/24/2019	Ethical Pitfalls for New and Not So New Lawyers		2.00				2.0	2.00

12/29/2019	Combatting Plaintiffs' Reptilian Tactics in Commercial Vehicle, Premises Liability, Products Liability, and Medical Malpractice		1.50					1.50
12/29/2019	Ethics Podcast	CTLA	2.00				2.0	2.00
2/2/2020	WC: An Update on Medicare Secondary Payer Compliance Issues	GBBA	2.00					2.00
2/11/2020	Appellate Procedure 101 (EDU200211)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
2/21/2020	Acting and the Litigator CLE (EDU200221)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	4.00				4.00
2/28/2020	The Evolving Workers' Compensation Claim	CTLA	4.00	3.50			0.5	4.00
2/28/2020	Evolving Workers' Compensation Claim	CTLA	4.00					4.00
3/20/2020	Going Viral in Workers' Compensation	CTLA	1.00	1.00				1.00
3/25/2020	COVID-19 Related Workplace Considerations: A Practical Discussion (ELE200325)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00					1.00
3/26/2020	COVID-19 and Workers' Compensation Practice – Questions and Answers (EWC200326)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
3/30/2020	Taking Your Practice Home: Tips to Digitally Transform Your Law Practice Quickly & Easily (ECS202330)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
3/31/2020	Executive Order No. 7K – Remote Notarization (ERP200331)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00					1.00
4/7/2020	Iffs and Buts of WC	CTLA	1.50					1.50
4/15/2020	Remote Depos; Tech, Tactics & Ethics	CTLA	1.00	0.75			0.25	1.00
4/16/2020	Arguing Appellate Cases via Video Conference During the COVID-19 Crisis (EAA200416)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50					1.50
4/22/2020	The Other Silent Killer: Confronting the Mental Illness Epidemic in the Legal Profession (ELW200422)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
4/23/2020	Arguing Appellate Cases via Video Conference During the COVID-19 Crisis (EAA200423)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50					1.50
4/24/2020	Video Conferencing Privacy and Security Basics (ECS200424)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00					1.00
4/30/2020	Current Appellate Cases and Doctrines in Premises Liability	CTLA	1.00	1.00				1.00
4/30/2020	Use of Telemedicine in Workers' Compensation Claims (EWC200430)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
5/6/2020	Lawyer Obligations in the Time of COVID-19 (EDU200506B)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
5/8/2020	Alone Together is the New Normal: Benefits and Pitfalls of Video Mediation (EAD200508)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
5/13/2020	Remote Depositions (ELS200513)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
5/21/2020	Using Microsoft Teams to Advocate for Clients in Connecticut Judicial Proceedings (ECS200521)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
5/21/2020	Telehealth: Understanding the Basics and the Recent COVID-19 Related Changes (EHL200521)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
5/29/2020	Incorporating Privacy Compliance into Your Practice (ECS200529)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	0.75			0.25	1.00
6/9/2020	Alternative Facts: The Lies of Executive Order 9066 (EEC200609)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/10/2020	FOIA in the Pandemic Age (EML200610)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/19/2020	What You Need to Know as Employers Reopen the Workplace (ELE200619)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
6/23/2020	Asian American Experiences under COVID-19: Looking Back to Move Forward in the Legal Profession (EDC200623)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50				1.5	1.50

6/24/2020	Videoconferencing Tutorial for Remote Depo	Litigation Services	1.00	1.00				1.00
8/12/2020	Constance Baker Motley Series: Segregated Communities and Opportunity (EMS200812)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50				1.5	1.50
9/14/2020	Ethics: 2019—The Year in Review (2020CLC-PE02)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
9/14/2020	Current Issues in the Workers' Compensation System (2020CLC-WP01)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
9/14/2020	The (Usually) Avoidable Catastrophe: Workers' Compensation Offsets in Social Security Disability Claims (2020CLC-WP03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
9/14/2020	Appellate Oral Argument from the inside Out (2020CLC-NE02)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
9/15/2020	How to Use the Official Connecticut Fee Schedule For Hospitals and Ambulatory Surgical Centers – A Primer for Attorneys	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
9/15/2020	Annual Review of Connecticut Supreme and Appellate Court Cases (2020CLC-CL01)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
9/15/2020	Safe Harbors and Calm Seas (2020CLC)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
9/16/2020	The Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What Every Lawyer Needs to Know (2020CLC-PE03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
9/16/2020	Strategies for Teaching Implicit Bias to Legal Professionals (2020CLC-PT03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
9/16/2020	The ADA at 30: Hot Topics (2020CLC-WP02)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.50	0.50				0.50
9/17/2020	Safe Harbors and Calm Seas (2020CLC)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
10/1/2020	Drafting Effective Engagement Letters (EDU201001)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
10/27 - 10/28/2020	Legal Ethics: Maintaining IOLTA & Law Office Management Best Practices CLE (EDU201027)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00				4.0	4.00
10/28/2020	What's New in Workers' Comp	CTLA	1.00	1.00				1.00
11/11/2020	10 Myths in Mild Brain Injuries		1.00					1.00
11/13/2020	Unmasking Changes: New Issues in Workers' Compensation Created by COVID-19 Exec. Orders (EWC201113)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	4.00				4.00
1/13/2021	The Ugliest Seminar of the Year	CTLA	2.00					2.00
2/11/2021	Unpacking Apportionment: Mages Tricks to Pull Out of a Hatt (EWC210211)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
3/17/2021	Trial Skills Series: Summation (EDU210317)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00		2.00			2.00
3/23/2021	How and Why to Use a Vocational Expert in Litigation (EYL210323)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
3/24/2021	Trial Skills Series: Direct Examination (EDU210324)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00		2.00			2.00
3/31/2021	Navigating the Workplace (EYL210331B)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
4/7/2021	ifs and Buts of WC	CTLA	1.50	1.50				1.50
4/7/2021	Trial Skills Series: Cross Examination (EDU210407)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00		2.00			2.00
5/26/2021	Trial Skills Series: Opening Statement (EDU210414)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00		2.00			2.00
6/15/2021	Ethics - The Year in Review 2021CLC-PE01	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/15/2021	Current Issues in the WC System 2021CLC-WP02	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/15/2021	Preparation for Formal Hearings 2021CIC-WP01	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00

6/16/2021	The Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What Every Lawyer Needs to Know 2021CLC-PE02	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/16/2021	Nuts and Bolts of Direct and Cross Examination and Dealing with Experts (2023CLC-TT04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00		2.00			2.00
6/16/2021	COVID-19 and The Workplace: How Far We Have Come, Where We Are, and Where We are Heading (2021CLC-WP03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/17/2021	The Appealing Road to Ethical Ruin (2021CLC-TT05)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/17/2021	Annual Employment Law Update (2021CLC-WP04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/17/2021	Safe Harbors and Calm Seas 2021CLC-LP03	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/17/2021	Mental Health and Qcquired Issues in the Disability Context (2021CLC-DI03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
10/29/2021	Attorney's Fees in Workers' Compensation: Do's, Don'ts, and Difficulties (EWC211029)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.25				2.3	2.25
10/29/2021	The Ifs, And, or Buts of WC	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.75	0.75				0.75
11/30/2021	Common Ethics Issues and Addressing IOLTA Audits and Grievances (EYL211130)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
12/8/2021	Cannabis in CT: Business, Criminal Justice and Insurance Considerations (EDU211208)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.50	0.50				0.50
12/31/2021	Total Disability: Everything You Need to Know	United Institute for CLE	2.00	2.00				2.00
12/31/2021	Remote Legal Work in the Post-Pandemic Age	United Institute for CLE	1.00				1.0	1.00
12/31/2021	Making Adverse Witnesses a Free Expert Witness	United Institute for CLE	1.75		1.75			1.75
12/31/2021	Killer Depositions: Tactics, Tips, & Techniques That Can Make or Break Your Case	United Institute for CLE	2.50		2.50			2.50
12/31/2021	How to use impeachment effectively in court	United Institute for CLE	1.25		1.25			1.25
12/31/2021	Fundamentals of Orthopedics for Lawyers: Anatomy, Injuries, and Common Procedures	United Institute for CLE	1.00			1.0		1.00
12/31/2021	Effective Use of Expert Witnesses in Your Case	United Institute for CLE	1.00		1.00			1.00
12/31/2021	Defending Construction Claims in the Workers' Compensation Arena: The Nuts and Bolts	United Institute for CLE	1.25	1.25				1.25
2/28/2022	Rivisiting Irving Younger's 10 Commandments of Cross-Examination	NA	6.00	5.00			1.0	6.00
3/22/2022	Workers' Compensation Retreat	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	9.00	9.00				9.00
5/3 -6/2022	Trial Advocacy Training - CT Attorney General's Office	National Association of Attorneys General	14.30		13.30		1.00	14.30
5/13/2022	From the Formal and Beyond	CTLA	4.00		4.00			4.00
Up to 5/21/2022	New WC Medicar Set-Aside Rules	NBI	3.00	3.00				3.00
6/13/2022	Ethics - The Year in Review 2022CLC-A04	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/13/2022	The Art of Successful Mediations 2022CLC-B01	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00					2.00
6/13/2022	Recent developments in CT Workers' Compensation	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/13/2022	Workers' Compensation Appeal Process 2022CIC-D10	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/13/2022	Better Safe Than Sorry 2022CLC-B04	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/13/2022	Better Safe Than Sorry 2022CLC-C04	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00

6/13/2022	The Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What Every Lawyer Needs to Know 2022CLC-C02	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/13/2022	Getting Paid: Ethical and Practical Considerations for Fees 2022CLC-D03	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/13/2022	State Liens, Claims, and 4a-16 Notices (2022CLC-D06)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.50		0.50			0.50
10/13/2022	Un-Ringing the Bell: Diagnosis and Treatment in Concussion and Brain Injury	WC Section	7.00	7.00				7.00
10/24/2022	IOLTA/Law Office Management (EDU221022)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00				3.0	3.00
12/2/2022	Client Intake - Who is the Right Client and How do You Manage the Financial Aspects of Your Relationship (EPC221202-2A)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
2/10/2023	The Ugliest Abbreviated	CTLA	1.00	1.00				1.00
2/24/2023	Workers' Compensation and its Collaboration with Other Tangential Benefits (STD, SSD, Pensions)	CT Trial Lawyers Foundation	5.00	5.00				5.00
3/9/2023	Cannabis in the CT Workplace: Labor Law and Workers' Compensation Considerations (ELE230309)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	1.00	1.00			2.00
3/23/2023	Ethics for Workers' Compensation Practitioners (EWC230323)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
4/24/2023	Workers' Compensation Liens and Subrogation (EYL230424)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
5/7/2023	Workers Compensation Retreat (SWC230506)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	8.75	4.50		2.8	1.5	8.75
6/5/2023	Ethics: The Year in Review (2023CLC-A04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
6/5/2023	How to Ethically Use Social Media Marketing and Best Practices to Optimize Growth While Also Safeguarding Your Practice (2023CLC-B04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/5/2023	Workers' Compensation Series: Let Me In - The Primrose Path of Jurisdiction (2023CLC-B10)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/5/2023	Ethical Duty of Technology Competence: What Every Lawyer Needs to Know (2023CLC-C02)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/5/2023	How to Ethically Use Social Media Marketing and Best Practices to Optimize Growth While Also Safeguarding Your Practice (2023CLC-C04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2.0	2.00
6/5/2023	Recent Developments in CT Workers' Compensation (2023CLC-C11)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/5/2023	Evidence in the Workers' Compensation Forum (2023CLC-D11)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/5/2023	The Symbiotic Relationship of Self-Care and Productivity (2023CLC-A06)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00				1.0	1.00
10/4/2023	Navigating Vocational and Earning Capacity Evaluations (EDU231004)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.50	3.50				3.50
10/13/2023	36th Annual College & Code of Evidence	CTLA	5.00	5.00				
10/25/2023	IOLTA/Law Office Management (EDU231025)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	3.00				3.0	3.00
10/27/2023	From the Subjective to the Radicular: Pain, the Final Frontier (EWC231027)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.00	7.00				7.00
11/29/2023	Technology and Legal ethics: defining "Competence" and Adapting to AI (EDU231129)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00				2	2.00
4/4/2024	Workers' Compensation Section Meeting	WC Section	1.25	1.25				1.25
4/12/2024	Practice, Procedure and Protocol in the Connecticut Courts (EDU240412)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	4.00	4.00				4.00
4/19/2024	The Fundamentals of a Trial	CTLA	5.00	5.00				5.00
5/5-7/2024	2024 Workers' Compensation Retreat	WC Section	8.50	7.50			1	8.50
6/10/2024	Recent Developments in CT Workers' Compensation (2024CLC-B09)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00

6/10/2024	Using MSA Funds Incorrectly (2024CLC-A11)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/10/2024	Generative AI: Advanced Uses and Practical Applications (2024CLC-D08)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
6/10/2024	Technology and Legal Ethics: Defining "Competence" and Adapting to AI (2024CLC-C02)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50				1.5	1.50
6/10/2024	How to Increase Your Advocacy Batting Average in ADR: Do's and Don'ts in Mediation and Arbitration (2024CLC-C07)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.75				0.75	0.75
6/10/2024	Zen and the Art of Being an Attorney (2024CLC-D07)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50				1.5	1.50
11/8/2024	Workplace Injuries: Treatment Tailored for a Swift Recovery (EWC241108)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	7.00			7		7.00
11/8/2024	Complex Cervical and Lumbar Case Review and Adjacent Segment Degeneration and Recurrent Disc Herniation in the Injured Worker (EWC241108-A)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.75			1.75		1.75
11/8/2024	Sports - Knee and Shoulder (EWC241108-B)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50			1.5		1.50
11/8/2024	I Still Haven't Found What I'm Looking For: Re-thinking the Job Search Requirement in the 21st Century (EWC241108-C)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.75			0.75		0.75
11/8/2024	Helping Hands and Optimizing Communication (EWC241108-D)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50			1.5		1.50
11/8/2024	Foot & ankle Complications: Complex Regional Pain Syndrome (CRPS) and Chronic Pain referrals to Pain Management (EWC241108-E)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50			1.5		1.50
4/15/2025	vLex Fastcase Training (EDU250415)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
5/22/2025	Oh, the Ways It Can Go! Settlement (SWC250518-A)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.75	2.75				2.75
5/22/2025	Commonly Misunderstood concepts in Medicare Secondary Payer Compliance (SWC250518-B)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
5/22/2025	The Waiting Game (SWC250518-C)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
5/22/2025	Schooling the Workers' Compensation Lawyer (SWC250518-D)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.25	1.25				1.25
5/22/2025	Ametros: The Benefits of Professional Administration (SWC250518-E)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	0.50	0.50				0.50
5/22/2025	Ethics in Workers' Compensation (SWC250518-F)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00			1.00		1.00
6/11 - 6/12/2025	NAAG Negotiation Skills	Connecticut Attorney General's Office	9.50	9.50				9.50
6/13/2025	Ethics: The Year in Review (2025CLC-A03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00			1.00		1.00
6/13/2025	Math for Lawyers: How to Calculate a BCR and More (2025CLC-A11)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.00	1.00				1.00
6/13/2025	Better Safe than Sorry! How to Avoid Legal Malpractice Pitfalls (2025CLC-B03)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00			2.00		2.00
6/13/2025	Recent Developments in CT Workers' Compensation (2025CLC-B07)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	2.00	2.00				2.00
6/13/2025	Better Safe than Sorry! How to Avoid Legal Malpractice Pitfalls (2025CLC-C04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50			1.50		1.50
6/13/2025	Technology and Legal Ethics: defining "Competence" and Adapting to AI (2025CLC-D04)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50			1.50		1.50
10/17/2025	Arising Out of and in the Course of Employment (EWC251017)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	6.00	6.00				6.00
10/17/2025	Origin and Cause and Time, Place and Circumstance (EWC251017-A)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
10/17/2025	On Premise v. Off Premise (EWC251017-B)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
10/17/2025	Travel (EWC251017-C)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50

10/17/2025	Affirmative Defenses (EWC251017-D)	CT Bar Institute, Inc.	1.50	1.50				1.50
11/6/2025	Civility and Your Work-Life	Connecticut Attorney General's Office	2.00				2.00	2.00